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Classic

RE: Like New Reimbursement Monday, January 25, 2010 2:37 PM

From: "Wedge, David" <David.Wedge@po.state.ct.us>
To: "Konecny, Mary" <KonecnyM@trumbullps.org>
Cc: cmassaro@snet.net, Al.barbarotta@afbcm.com, jmn@quidproquo.com

Ralph —

Removal of the proposed new natatorium from the scope of the proposed high school renovation project would
not adversely impact our consideration of the project as a renovation (a.k.a. “Renovate-as-New"). However, if
the natatorium is constructed, Trumbull will need to make sure all costs associated with the natatorium are well
documented and accounted for separately from the high school renovation project. This may already be an
issue as it appears there are architectural design costs associated with the natatorium that have been included
in the design costs currently reported as expended on the grant payment request (form ED046.)

Call me at (860) 713-6467 if you have any questions.
Dave Wedge

Cc: File 144-0101

From: Konecny, Mary [mailto:KonecnyM@trumbullips.org]
Sent: Monday, January 25, 2010 1:26 PM

To: Wedge, David

Cc: cmassaro@snet.net; Al.barbarotta@afbcm.com; jmn@quidproquo.com
Subject: Like New Reimbursement

Good Afternoon, David!
Happy New Year — hope all is going well!

Per your ongoing request that key questions on the THS Renovate as New Project, SDE Project # 144-
0101/EA/RR, be forwarded from the Superintendent of Schools, | would ask you to respond to the following
question that members of my Town Council are posing:

Will the elimination of the natatorium and/or funding for the same disqualify reimbursement of the
project under the “like new” approval?

Thank you,
Ralph

Mary T. Konecny on behalf of
Ralph M. lassognha, Superintendent
Trumbull Public Schools

6254 Main Street

Trumbull, CT 06611

(p) 203.452.4301 (f) 203.452.4305

Please reach us on the web at

http://us.mc811.mail.yahoo.com/mc/showMessage?pSize=25&sMid=0& fid=Inbox&mid=... 1/25/2010



