

Town of Trumbull - Engineering Department

Results for REBid #6338

Town-Wide Application of Polymer Asphalt Surface Sealer - "CHIP SEAL"

Due July 2, 2019 at 2:00 PM

	Company/Address	Base Bid	Alternative 1	Alternative 2
	Seymour Sealing Service, Inc. 147 North Plains Rd Wallingford, Ct 06492	Over 15,500 SY	7,801 - 15,500 SY	2,401 - 7,800 SY
1	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/2" trap rock	\$ 5.60	\$ 6.60	\$ 7.60
2	Complete in place Chip Seal using 3/8" trap rock	\$ 4.60	\$ 5.60	\$ 6.60
3	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/4" trap rock	\$ 4.50	\$ 5.50	\$ 6.50
4	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/2 minus screened from RAP	\$ 5.70	\$ 6.70	\$ 7.70
5	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 3/8" trap rock	\$ 4.40	\$ 5.40	\$ 6.40
6	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 1/4" trap rock	\$ 4.30	\$ 5.30	\$ 6.30
7	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 1/2" trap rock	\$ 5.40	\$ 6.40	\$ 7.40
8	Option to provide road sweeping services per machine	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 140.00
9	Fog Seal installed with SS-1, SS-1h, CSS-1, CSS-1h at	\$ 1.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 1.50
10	Fog Seal installed with PASS-QB at	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.75	\$ 2.00
11	Crushing of millings (RAP)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12	Segragating 1/2 " minus from millings to be used for chip seal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13	Production of Cold Mix per ton measured by pug mill discharge display	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14	Complete installation of Cold Mix	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum notificaiton requirement			720 HOURS	

	Company/Address	Base Bid	Alternative 1	Alternative 2
		Over 15,500 SY	7,801 - 15,500 SY	2,401 - 7,800 SY
	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/2" trap rock	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Complete in place Chip Seal using 3/8" trap rock	\$ 2.02	\$ 3.59	\$ 6.00
	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/4" trap rock	\$ 1.81	\$ 3.02	\$ 5.25
	Complete in place Chip Seal using 1/2 minus screened from RAP	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 3/8" trap rock	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 1/4" trap rock	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Complete in place Chip Seal using recycled 1/2" trap rock	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Option to provide road sweeping services per machine	\$ 259.00	\$ 259.00	\$ 259.00
	Fog Seal installed with SS-1, SS-1h, CSS-1, CSS-1h at	\$ 0.45	\$ 0.70	\$ 1.10
	Fog Seal installed with PASS-QB at	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Crushing of millings (RAP)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Segragating 1/2 " minus from millings to be used for chip seal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Production of Cold Mix per ton measured by pug mill discharge display	\$ 25.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00
	Complete installation of Cold Mix	\$ 30.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 40.00
Minimum notificaiton requirement			336 HOURS	

Kevin Bova Purchasing Agent
Due July 2, 2019 at 2:00 PM